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As one of three hearing daughters of deaf parents, 12-year-old Gussie Davis is expected to be a proper
representative of Saint Jude’s Church for the Deaf in Birmingham, Alabama, which is run by her father. So
when Gussie starts to hum through signed services in the summer of 1948, Reverend Davis assumes she
merely wants to sing out loud and sends her to a regular church downtown. But Gussie’s behavior worsens,
and she is not allowed to go on a much-anticipated trip; instead, she must help her father at the Alabama
School for the Deaf.

Rebelling against the strict rules of the school, Gussie finally confronts the difficulties and prejudices
encountered by the deaf community, all while still trying to find her own identity in the worlds of both the
hearing and the deaf.

Drawing on firsthand accounts of her mother’s own childhood with deaf parents, Delia Ray provides an
inside look at the South in the 1940s. Lively humor, unforgettable characters, and meticulous research
combine to make this a standout novel that offers keen insight into what it means to be hearing in a deaf
world. Author’s note.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Scott:

This Singing Hands usually are reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The key
reason why of this Singing Hands can be one of the great books you must have is giving you more than just
simple reading through food but feed anyone with information that possibly will shock your earlier
knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Singing Hands forcing you to have an enormous of
experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your
day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Kimberly Langdon:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get
a lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can
easily share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader
with their story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of them is this
Singing Hands.

Ann Goddard:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, brief story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving Singing Hands that give your
entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading addiction all over the
world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how they react in the
direction of the world. It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for
all of you who wants to be success person. So , for every you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, you are able to pick Singing Hands become your own personal starter.

Sheila Dickerson:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside appear
likes. Maybe you answer may be Singing Hands why because the wonderful cover that make you consider
regarding the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or maybe
cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.
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