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EPISODE 7 OF 8: Determined to gather evidence confirming Brick's traitorous activities, NBS agent Arthur
Hall with the help of new agents Felicity Wilson, and Dr. Leah Carlsson begins organizing a sting, one he
hopes will also expose Brick's rogue contact deep within NBS, whom he believes is Agent Sullivan.
Meanwhile, with Project Tessarap nearly finished, Mr. Andrew Lennox, head of The Syndicate's high-class
prostitution ring, is planning a test-run of the organic thin-film transistors capable of stealing sensitive data
from cell phones. Lennox invites Felicity to join his business dinner with TriMark's Dr. Adams to serve as a
distraction. But she secretly has her own personal mission that evening: to seduce Brick, and place a
transistor on his phone, trusting it will provide Agent Hall with the evidence he needs to incriminate him.
Just as Agent Hall's plan begins to take shape, Felicity is made a startling offer. Will she question her own
morality? More importantly, can she keep the pact?

-- ABOUT THE SERIES: NBS agents are trained for one purpose: bringing down The Syndicate, an
international crime organization aimed at profiteering by keeping countries at war with one another. When
an NBS agent is murdered shortly before her first assignment, five new recruits quickly realize the agency
they're working for may not be as trustworthy as it seems, forcing them to make a pact in order to survive.
Can the new agents stay alive long enough to uncover the truth behind their fellow recruit's death? Or is
finding answers hidden deep within both organizations tempting enough to make one of them break the pact?

-- For fans of Robert Ludlum, THE BOURNE IDENTITY, John le Carré, THE SPY WHO CAME IN
FROM THE COLD, Daniel Silva, THE UNLIKELY SPY and HOMELAND.

-- Christian Liberty Marshall is an Austrian-based writer, and musician with degrees from Vanderbilt
University, and University of Music and Performing Arts Graz. When not performing as a violist, he can be
found teaching at the Popakademie Baden-Württemberg, writing educational material for children, or
translating German literature. His first serial novel, The Pact, is available in summer 2015.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Burdette:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled The Pact - Episode 7: Escape (A Deadly Espionage Thriller Series). Try
to stumble through book The Pact - Episode 7: Escape (A Deadly Espionage Thriller Series) as your buddy.
It means that it can to get your friend when you truly feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than
previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can
know almost everything by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Joshua Mack:

The guide untitled The Pact - Episode 7: Escape (A Deadly Espionage Thriller Series) is the reserve that
recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person.
The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot
of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely
accurate. You also might get the e-book of The Pact - Episode 7: Escape (A Deadly Espionage Thriller
Series) from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Gwen Anderson:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get large
amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will
say absolutely sure. People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time,
typically the book you have read is definitely The Pact - Episode 7: Escape (A Deadly Espionage Thriller
Series).

Cherry Simard:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like The Pact - Episode 7: Escape (A
Deadly Espionage Thriller Series) which is finding the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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